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RECEIVED 

CONTRACT APPROVAL F~CT MANAGEMENT 

CONTRACTOR INFORMATION 

Name: SPS, Szoke Power System 

Address: PO Box 8897 

28H SEP 11 AH 9: 45 

Fleming Island, 
City 

FL 
State 

(Contract Management Use only) 

CONTRACT 
TRACKING NO. 

32006 
Zip 

Contractor's Administrator Name:---"F'""""r""'ed"'--"'-Sz""o""'k""'e ______________ Title:. _________ _ 

Tel#: 904-487-9515 Fax: ____ Email: szokepower@hotmail.com 

CONTRACT INFORMATION 

Contract Name: Generator Annual Maintenance and Service Agreement Contract Value: $38,125.00 

Brief Description: Provide Annual Maintenance and Service to County Owned Generators and provide service to any new generators 
the County may purchases that are not included on the list. (Various Locations). W <""-:J 

':.:~) 

Contract Dates: From: 10/1/13 to 9/30/16 Status: _x_ New Renew 
(I') 

Amend# _W A/Task Order ,., . -o .... :'"] 
ty N ;::::-> l 

How Procured: Sole Source _ Single Source _ ITB _ RFP ___X_RFQv""_ Coop. _Other -----=0=--- --- . ; 

If Processing an Amendment: 

.. 
Contract#: _______ Increase Amount of Existing Contract: __________ No Increase~ .--, 

+":' (,) 

New Contract Dates: _____ to ____ _ TOTAL OR AMENDMENT AMOUNT: ---------

1. 

2. 

4. 

APP~VAL__§Y~S~NT TO NASSAU COUNTY PURCHASING POLICY, SECTION 6 

~~~1'- ) :Jd,43 VariousLocations 
Department Head Signature 1 Date =Fu--=n""d:':in--=g=-:::So=ur-==ce"'":/:-7A=cc-t-:#:-----------

0JNu.A~ 
Contract Manage~~ Date 

Date 

See attached list for the funding accounts, 
agreement to include any additional generators 
purchased by Nassau County. 

w 
Comments: ____________________________________ ~L ,., 

RETURN ORIGINAL(S) TO CONTRACT MANAGEMENT FOR DISTRIBUTION AS FOLLOWS: 

Revised 9/24/2012 

Original: Clerk's Services; Contractor (original or certified cop_,il d""'S t\UL 
Copy: Department £S ~Z\ \;td Ll .J 

Office of Management & Budget 
Contra~t Management ~ . n~~l~O~ 
Clerk Fmance iH3~\3tJ'iN'fft l 
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Date: August 13, 2013 

SPS, Szoke Power System 
PO Box8897 

Fleming Island, Fl. 32006 
Phone (904) 487-9515 

Email: szokepower@hotmail.com 

Nassau County Board of County Commissioners 
Generator Annual Maintenance and Service Agreement 

SPS, Szoke Power System is a fully insured generator maintenance company. Our 
services include providing the Annual Maintenance and Service and repairs, for the 
county owned generators. SPS Szoke Power System maintains a drug- free work place. 

Board of County Commissioners ofNassau County, hereinafter called the "Owner" and 
SPS, Szoke Power System, hereinafter called the "Contractor," in consideration of the 
mutual covenants herein contained and of other good and valuable consideration, the 
receipt of which is hereby acknowledged, hereby agrees as follows: 

1. Duration of Contract. The contractor shall perform its services under this 
contract, as set forth on the Scope of Work. All prices are guaranteed for three 
(3) years effective October 1, 2013- through September 30, 2016. This 
contract may be cancelled by either party upon thirty (30) days written notice. 

2. Services. The Contractor shall perform the services as listed in the attached 
Scope of Work. 

3. Payment. The Owner shall pay to the Contractor for services under this 
Contract as per the Florida Statutes 218.73 & 218.74. (Terms Net 45 Days) 
Payment shall be remitted to: SPS, Szoke Power System, PO Box 8897, 
Fleming Island, FL. 32006 

The Parties have signed and agreed to this contract as of the date set forth below. 

SP , Szoke Power System 
Fred Szoke, President 

Re~-
Nassau County Board of County Commissioners 

Sex:-t Q"" ~ e_v- 5) 20' ~ 
Date 

"t I rq /r> 
Date 



NASSAU COUNTY 
FACILTIES MAINTENANCE DEPARTMENT 

Office Mailing Address: 45195 Musselwhite Road- Callahan, FL 32011 

Nassau County BOCC Mailing Address: 
76347 Veterans Way, Suite 4000 -Yulee, FL 32097 
Email: bknott@nassaucountyfl.com 

SCOPE ofWORK 

Telephone: (904) 548-4688 
Alternate: (904) 879-3751 

Fax: (904) 548-4687 

(All requests for quotations must be accompanied by this Scope of Work) 

Nassau County Board of County Commissioners 
Generator Annual Maintenance and Service Agreement 

Nassau County is requesting quotations for the Annual Maintenance and Service required for each 
County Owned Generator, as well as any new generators purchased during agreement period. (See 
attached list indicating the location and Generator information.) 

Provide rates for the following: Annual Maintenance and Service as required per Generator: 
• 3 Quarterly Minor Services 
• 1 Major Service 
• 1 Load Bank Test 
• List materials with applicable charges for each Generator as listed. 

Provide rates for the following services or charges: 
• Regular Hourly rate. 
• Overtime Hourly rate. 
• Any additional mileage charge. 
• Truck Charges 
• Enviromnental Charges (that would be applicable for any work, scheduled or unscheduled). 
• Any charge not listed please provide detailed information. 

*Please Note: 
• Prior to any work, scheduled or unscheduled, proper authorization must be obtained. A PO 

number will be issued for Annual Maintenance, for any additional repairs a control number 
must be obtained by contacting the office or through the technician reporting service needs. 

• Funding Accounts Numbers have been provided to identify each generator by the department. 
Please indicate this on all and any invoices to expedite billing processing. 

• As generators are being replaced with new units, we will be placing the existing generators at 
other locations. New units will be under warrantee for the first year. (as noted on attached 
spreadsheet). 

• Please provide costs for each Annual Maintenance Service for the following period. 
o Octl, 2013 -Sept 30, 2014= FY 13/14 
o Octl, 2014- Sept 30, 2015= FY 14/15 
o Oct1, 2015- Sept 30, 2016= FY 15116 

Please respond with pricing to our office by August 14, 2013, should you want to be considered for the 
Annual Maintenance and Service Agreement, if not please respond with a "No Quote". 

All prices must be guaranteed for three (3) years effective October 1, 2013- through September 30, 
2016. Any questions you may have please contact Don Castle 904-753-1046, you may also email our 
Director-Bob Knott at: bknott@nassaucountyfl.com 



Quote Summary Generator Maintenance and Serivce. 

County Generators Listed on 

Location Attachement Annual Service 
3 Year Service Agreement 10-1-13- 9-30-16 Per Hour Per Hour Per Hour 

(M-F) 

Vendor Annual Service Week day Overtime sat Sundays Holidays Per Mile 

SPS, Szoke Power System Received $ 38,125.00 $ 78.00 $ 117.00 $ 156.00 $ 156.00 $ 1.00 

JL Power Systems Received $ 41,415.00 $ 82.00 $ 123.00 $ 164.00 $ 164.00 $ 1.25 

Florida Detroit Diesel Annual Service Separate 3 years $ 46,221.00 $ 47,609.50 $ 49,060.03 $ 80.00 $ 120.00 $ 120.00 $ 160.00 $ 225.00 50.00 Per Trip 

B&K Diesel Engines Confirmed with No Bid Email No Bid 0 0 0 0 
Page Masters No Bid Received 

---------------

'~;: 
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Suzie Fontes 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 

Jimmy Jacobs <JJacobs@fdda.com> 
Tuesday, August 13, 2013 4:04 PM 
Suzie Fontes 

Subject: RE: 2010 generator maintenance RFQ- Bid Tabulation 

Thanks Suzie. 

Jimmy Jaco6s 
Florida Detroit Diesel-Allison, Inc. 
Generator/Fire Pump 
Field Service Sales Rep. 
407-888-1700 Office 
866-902-4064 Fax 
407-948-7402 Mobile 

From: Suzie Fontes [mailto:sfontes@nassaucountyfl.com] 
Sent: Tuesday, August 13, 2013 3:55 PM 
To: Jimmy Jacobs 
Subject: RE: 2010 generator maintenance RFQ- Bid Tabulation 

Please forgive me for the delay. 

Here is the Quotes Received from 6/1/11 
Szokes Power Systems Annual $ 25,080.00 
Florida Detroit Diesel $ 25,995.00 
Ring Power $ 26,401.00 
N. Fl. Power Systems $ 28,389.00 

From: Jimmy Jacobs [mailto:JJacobs@fdda.com] 
Sent: Monday, August 12, 2013 10:10 AM 
To: Suzie Fontes 
Subject: Re: 2010 generator maintenance RFQ - Bid Tabulation 

Thank you. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Aug 12, 2013, at 10:09 AM, "Suzie Fontes" <sfontes@nassaucountyfl.com> wrote: 

Great, I have reached out to another department to see if we can get a Bid Tabulation for 
you. 

1 



NASSAU COUNTY 
FACILTIES MAINTENANCE DEPARTMENT 

Office Mailing Address: 45195 Musselwhite Road- Callahan, FL 32011 

Nassau County BOCC Mailing Address: 
76347 Veterans Way, Suite 4000 -Yulee, FL 32097 
Email: bknott@nassaucountyfl.com 

SCOPE ofWORK 

Telephone: (904) 548-4688 
Alternate: (904) 879-3751 

Fax: (904) 548-4687 

(All requests for quotations must be accompanied by this Scope of Work) 

Nassau County Board of County Commissioners 
Generator Annual Maintenance and Service Agreement 

Nassau County is requesting quotations for the Annual Ma~tenance and Service required for each 
County Owned Generator, as well as any new generators purchased during agreement period. (See 
attached list indicating the location and Generator infonnation.) 

Provide rates for the following: Annual Maintenance and Service as required per Generator: 
• 3 Quarterly Minor Services 
• 1 Major Service 
• 1 Load Bank Test 
• List materials with applicable charges for each Generator as listed. 

Provide rates for the following services or charges: 
• Regular Hourly rate. 
• Overtime Hourly rate. 
• Any additional mileage charge. 
• Truck Charges 
• Enviro:nmental Charges (that would be applicable for any work, scheduled or unscheduled). 
• Any charge not listed please provide detailed information. 

*Please Note: 
• Prior to any work, scheduled or unscheduled, proper authorization must be obtained. A PO 

number will be issued for Annual Maintenance, for any additional repairs a control number 
must be obtained by contacting the office or through the technician reporting service needs. 

• Funding Accounts Numbers have been provided to identify each generator by the depmiment. 
Please indicate this on all and any invoice~ to expedite billing processing. 

• As generators are being replaced with new units, we will be placing the existing generators at 
other locations. New units will be under warrantee for the first year. (as noted on attached 
spreadsheet). 

• Please provide costs for each Annual Maintenance Service for the following period. 
o Oct1, 2013- Sept 30, 2014= FY 13114 
o Oct1, 2014- Sept 30, 2015= FY 14/15 
o Oct1, 2015- Sept 30, 2016= FY 15/16 

Please respond with pricing to our office by August 14, 2013, should you want to be considered for the 
Aimual Maintenance and Service Agreement, if not please respond with a "No Quote". 

All prices must be guaranteed for three (3) years effective October 1, 2013- through September 30, 
2016. Any questions you may have please contact Don Castle 904-753-1046, you may also email our 
Director-Bob Knott at: bknott@nassaucountyfl.com 



Suzie Fontes 

From: Suzie Fontes 
Sent: 
To: 

Friday, August 09, 2013 3:48 PM 
mmcgauley@fdda.com 

Subject: FW: Nassau County Generator- Request for Quote 
Attachments: Florida Detroit Disel Gen Quote.pdf; Revised 8.9.13 All Generator Locations.xls 

Please see the attached Amendment #1 to the Generator Spreadsheet sent out on August 2, 2013. I also 
attached the Original Request - Scope of Work. We are extending the due date to August 19, 2013 due 
to the revisions. 
Thank you, 

From: Suzie Fontes 
Sent: Friday, August 02, 2013 10:25 AM 
To: 'mmcgauley@fdda.com' 
Subject: FW: Nassau County Generator- Request for Quote 

From: Suzie Fontes 
Sent: Friday, August 02, 2013 10:07 AM 
To: 'mmcgauley@fdea.com' 
Subject: Nassau County Generator- Request for Quote 

Emailed on Behalf of Don Castle: 

Please see all attachments. 

Suzie Fontes- Office Manager 
Nassau County Facilities Maintenance/Parks & Recreation Dept. 
45195 Musselwhite Road, Callahan, Fl 32011 
Office 904-548-4688 ext 6303 Fax: 904-548-4687 

1 
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Nassau County Board of County Commissioners 
Request for Quotation Form 

Requesting D~part:ment; Facilities Ma:intenance Date: . ' 8/2/13 

Department Address: 

Contact: 

Contact email: 
Department Phone: 
Department Fax: 

45195 Musselwhite lload, Callahan, Fl32011 

Don Castle (Maintenance Tech:) 904-753-1046 
or Bob Knott (Director) 904-548A688 

Bob Knott- Dhectm·: blmott@nassaucoutttyfl.com. 
(904) 548-4688 ox (904) 548-4689 
(904) 548-4687 . 

P:toduct(s)!Servlce(s) to be purchased (list all specifications and requirements): 

See attached Scope of Work for Nassau County Board of County .Cmumissioners-,Generato1· 
Annual Maintenance m1d Service Agreement (See attached doc1,m1ents). . .. 

Please note: 
This document must b~ completed and sent back with the attached Scope of Work with 
your quotation. · 

)> If additionallaltem.ate sc.ope of service or product is recommended, please provide as a 
separate attachment:. Additional Attachment Yes .___X_ No 

*All payments for products /services are as pe.r Flo~1da StattJtes 218.73 & 218.7 4 (Tenns net 45 days). * 

Please snb:mit written response by: A.ucyst 14, ).013 
(Date) 

/)"'---) C1 I '% , Uj I,.. , t..LzLt(j ; j Cf 1/7 " > 
• -~ l I I/_) 

Faxed I Scanned/Emailed to Vendor on 2/ :</JJ! . to the attention of H ep. 
~ j. . 

To be completed by vendor: . 
VendoxName; St6 k:-;e s r buJ~ S'1sf-'<41s. 
Address: 2lS3 13\ll~ \-\ gV'o""' Co'~~ \.:::>"\"+" 

"F\;o""-·, "'-:',;> T <;:,\c,,-, d ,£L, $'200;3 

Phone: qb4·'-I~I~L1S1 '5 Fax: _ __o:,.....==+ri""::L-~---
Contact; fved. S·z.p K:e 
Email: . -<> 'i-; ic:, .. q:H,,...,e" ~ \,-,tr\v-r-.~·. \.co·~ 

Attached is a wxitten ql!Qte from our company, which iB valid for 

~4~ Date 

Connnenre: __________________________ ~-------~------



NASSAU COUNTY 
FACILTIES MAINTENANCE DEPARTMENT 

OfficeMalJingAddress: 45195 Musselwhite Ro~d ~Callahan, FL 32011 

Nassau County BOCC Mailing AddJ•ess: 
76347 Veterans Way, Suite 4000 ~Yulee, FL 32097 
Email: bknott@nassm.tcountyfl,com · 

SCOPE of WORK 

Telephone: (904) 548-4688 
Alternate: (904) 879~3751· 

Fax: (904) 548A687 

(All reque~ts fol' quotatioris must be accompanied by this Scope {}fWork) 

Nassau ComitY Board ()f Cotinty.;Commissioners 
Generator Anl:hia:rMaintell.an~e .and Service Agreement 

r- ••• 'I• ,-. ···•:· ••· 

~· (' 

Nassau County is reqv~sHi}gquqiatio~i.~forthe Annue,l M?:irttenance !l,:nd Service required for each 
County Owned Gep.¢'tator; as well i:t.S any 1iew ger(e1'ators purchased '~ming ~greement p~riod. (See 
attached list :indicatfilg the:iocilti9n iul.d Generf),to1· 1tit'olinatioiL) · · ' · ·· ' · · · 

f'' . ··, i·:·"i . .• ;·.:·: 

Provide tates fDrtl1e following: Ammal Mai11teiJ.ance ~nd $ervtce a~ reql~i!~d:p~r, Qenei'ator: 
• 3 Qua~1ydyMinor Services '· · · · ·' · ·· · ' 
• 1 M?.JPr Se£vice · · 
• 1 L~M J3~pk Test , 
• Lisftn<J,terials·With appJt¢a91~ oharges f()teach G~lJ._E\l'atQt as 1i$tt:<d. 

,, .... : • . ' ::' : •• .! • ' • • :-' ' ~.. • . -... ' • 

Provide rat~sf~{flle foiiowingservice~ or oha1·ges:. 
• RegnJar1Ich1dy rate. ' . · 
a Ov~ltln;i~H<mi'ly ra.t~. ·· .. . . .. 
• Any• ~4dit_lqli~Linileagt) charge:' · 
• TruCl\ Charges .. .· .. . •. . , 
• EnviroJ¥neiltal Charges (tlwt would be applicable fot any worl{~ sch~dt.tlc;a 9i· unscheduled). 
• Any chatge }lOt .listed please provide detailed information. · ·· · -· · · · · . . 

~ . 

. ·: .. 
*Please Note; .. . ·- · · . .. _ . , .. . . . ·.·· .··.· 

• Prior to tcnv woNc, scheduJ.ed. or l\l}scliedtiled, proper auth61-i:iation';tn1Jst be obtained. A P0 
number will be issued for Afl4y~l Main~el1~n~e, foi ariY addiiioiu11 repairs a conttol nurnber 
must be obtained by COlltacting tb_ti office or tlJi·oughtJ:le tetbnician l'eporting service need~. 

• Funding Accounts Numbers h~ve beeri provided to identify each generator by the departnlent. 
Please indicate this on all and any invoice~ to expedite billing processiug. · 

• As generators axe being replaced with new units) we will be placing the existing genetators at 
other locations. Ne'\V units will be tmder wan·~ntee for the first yeaJ. (as noted on attached 
spteadsheet). 

• Please provide costs for each Annllal Maintenance Servke for the following period. 
o Octl, 2013 -Sept 30, 2014= FY i3/14 
o Oct1,2014- Sept 30, 2015= FY 14/15 
o Octl~ 2015 - Sept30, 2016= FY 15116 

Please respond with pticing to our office by August 14, 2013, should you. want to be considered for the · 
Aiumal Mainte11a11ce and Service AgreenieJJ.t, if not please respond with a ''No Quote", 

All prices must be guaranteed for three (3) years effective October 1, 2013- through September 30, 
2016. Any questions you may have please contact Don Castle 904-753-1046, you may also email our 
Director-Bob Knott at: bknott@nassaucountyfl.coin · 



Rate Sheet 

SPS, Szoke Power Systems Inc, is pleased to present these rates to you. 

SPS works five days per week, Monday through Friday 
We charge: 
$78 per hour regular time. 8am to 4:30pm. 
$117 per hour for overtime and Saturday work 
$156 per hour for Sundays and holidays 

Time starts when vehicle is started. 

Travel is $1.00 per mile, from Fleming Island, FL. (between Orange Park and Green Cove Springs FL) 

SPS is on call24/7 and will always have my phone nearby. 

SPS has new model year, dependable trucks, fully loaded with tools and service manuals. 
SPS uses GPS navigation to find any site you give, and I keep those sites mapped. 
SPS is fully insured. 

Thank you for considering SPS to provide your service needs. 
Fred Szoke 



Suzie Fontes 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Yes 

Fred Szoke <szokepower@hotmail.com> 
Thursday, August 22, 2013 11:30 AM 
Suzie Fontes 
Re: Mileage charges 

Whichever point to benefit customer 

Sent from my iPhone Fred Szoke Power Systems Inc 

On Aug 22, 2013, at 10:54 AM, 11 Suzie Fontes 11 <sfontes@nassaucountyfl.com> wrote: 

>Confirming the cost is $1.00 per mile from any point that you are at. 
> 

> -----Original Message-----
> From: Fred Szoke [mailto:szokepower@hotmail.com] 
>Sent: Thursday, August 22, 2013 10:41 AM 
>To: Suzie Fontes 
> Cc: Fred Szoke 
>Subject: Mileage charges 
> 

>Service calls will generate a mileage charge from the point of contact 
> if I am at office mileage will be from Fleming Island Florida to the job 
>site 
> 

>If I am already in Jacksonville or in Nassau County it'll be from that 
> point of contact whatever is closer for customer benefit 
> 

> If I am in Orlando working it would be from the my Office 
> 

> These charges are to offset fuel Maintenance costs 
> Please let me know if you need anything else thank you 
> 

> Sent from my iPhone Fred Szoke Power Systems Inc 

1 
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These Columns are County Reference. NASSAU COUNTY GENERATORS Szokes 'Changes ;rre highlighted in BLUE 

::0 
~ 
~ 

;:: ~ 

-t ~ ::0 
" 

., ~ 

& " ~ 

.3 0 

~ 
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Cll 
0 ~ ::0 tl Nassau County Funding Account ~ 

= 0 w 

DEPT. (For Budget Purposes). LOCATION Service Requirements. ~ = BRAND KW 0 PHASE ADDRESS PRIMARY USE 
"' "' 

0 ;> 

NAU 71500536-546000 Nassau Amelia Utilities 5390 First Coast Highway, FB FL 32034 Waste Water Plant 1 Annual Major Service Inspection y CAT 400KVA 480 3 

NAU 71500536-546000 Nassau Amelia Utilities Omni/Plantation 6027 Villa Partial 3 RepumpWTP I Annual Major Service Inspection y CAT 565KW 480 3 

NAU 71500536-546000 Nassau Amelia Utilities Plant 5390 First Coast Highway, FB FL 32034 Trailer Mount Generator I Annual 11ajor Service Inspection y Armstrong Power 140KVA 230/480 1-3 Phase 

NAU 71500536-546000 Nassau Amelia Utilities Plant 5390 First Coast Highway, FB FL 32034 Water Treatment Plant 1 Annual Major Service Inspection y CATD343 312KVA 480 3 

NAU 71500536-546000 Nassau Amelia Utilities - Lift Station 16 6 Amelia Village Circle, FB FL 32034 Lift Station 16 1 Annual Major Service Inspection y ONAN 85KW 208 3 

JPGC 01188519-546036 James Page Governmental Cornplex-Onan 96135 Nassau Place, Yulee COMM. BOARD RM One major, three minors, full 2 hour load bank test. y y y ONAN 60 120/240 THREE 

JPGC 01188519-546036 James Page Governmental Complex-Detroit Diesel 96135 Nassau Place, Yulee Prop Appr. SOE & Tax Collector One major, three minors, full2 hour load bank test. y y y Detroit Diesel 125 480 THREE 

Judicial Annex 01189712-534000 Judicial Annex-Courthouse 76435 Veteran's Way, Yulee JUD!ClAL COURTHOUSE One major, three minors, full2 hour load bank test. y y y CUMMINS 300 480 THREE 

Judicial Annex-Rec. 01189712-534000 Judicial Annex Records Management Building 76435 Veteran's Way, Yulee RECORDS MAN. BLDG. on-e major, three minors, fu112 hour load bank test. y y y CATERPJL 75 480 THREE 

Other Co. Bldgs 01193519-546036 Sheriff Admin· 911 Dispatch 50 Bobby Moore Circle, Yulee 911 DISPATCH One major, three minors, full 2 hour load bank test. y y y GENERAC 100 480 THREE 

Other Co. Bldgs 01193519-546036 Repeater Tower- West Side at Landfill 46351 Landfill Rd, Callahan Florida. REPEATER TOWER WEST SIDE One major, three minors, full2 hour load bank test. y y y GENERAC 15 240 SlNGLE 

Other Co. Bldgs 01193519-546036 Hilliard Health Clinic (Health Dept Reimburses County) 221 Pecan St., Hilliard, Fl. 32046 HEALTH DEPT. One major, three minors y N y KOHLER 15 240 THREE 

01072523-546036 Detention Center, Jail 76212 Nicholas Catinba Rd. Yulee DETENTION CENTER One major, three minors, full2 hour load bank test. y y y TAYLOR 300 THREE 

Fire Rescue 01261526-546000 Fire Rescue #30 (Relocating a Tower Site 50 K\V to this location Oct 2013) 86026 Pages Dairy Rd., Yulee FR#30 One major, three minors. y N y GENERAC 50 .·:. 240 SlNGLE 

Fire Rescue 01261526-546000 Fire Rescue #40 Pea Farm Rd. Hilliard FR#40&WELL One major, three minors. y N y GENERAC 50 240 SlNGLE 

~· .· "-c_c· ., . . . Gl~8!32e §~eGGG ··' .. · ... · ... < c ¥ei s!fitian #+ ·' . _.;,, . ·' .. .' ·l4~e Hassa~cille Ret, FemaHaffia Beh. ~--- .. .: •• MG'flH.,B .... .. "1 Afffi-tl&l MajeF £~F<i€e :J3,s~6eHeH N N ¥ . ", -~- 6 ;;4.9' @.!GJ:;g. 

~ ·<c. . lll2el32!i5~eGGG .. '· 
.... . ---vaiSt.ftti'e-~ #d .; ;'.· ,:, :, .• 

GaeaereaaDrL·eYlliee, Fl. 3:iG9'1 .'•.· MOBJLll'Jl>ll1' ; ·.• ···· .. rtrlm>¥liMaj ai Ser\lee IRSf,eetiefi . .·· · .. ·. N .N ¥ .. ·.:~- 6 · .. .;!49; ·~ 
Fire Rescue 01261526-546000 Fire Rescue #70 (Relocating a Tower Site 50 K\V to this location Oct 2013) 4061 Pine Grove Rd.(O'Neil), FB, FL 32034 One major, three minors, full2 hour load bank test. y N y Generac 50 240 SlNGLE 

Fire Rescue 01261526-546000 Fire Rescue Head Quarters & Fire Rescue 20 (NEW) 96160 Nassau Place, Yulee, FL32097 Trailer 1\iount- One major, three minors, full2 hour load bank test. y N y Tradewind 56 240 SlNGLE 

BOCCRadio 1252525-546000-MCOMM Hilliard Tower Site (Current units will be placed throught the Co.) 371105 Oxford St, Hilliard Radio System One major, three minors, full2 hour load bank test. y y y Generac 35 240 SlNGLE 

BOCCRadio 1252525-546000-MCOMM Callahan Tower Site (Current units "-ill be placed throught the Co.) 46351 Landfill Rd Radio System One major, three minors, full2 hour load bank test. y y y Generac 50 240 SlNGLE 

BOCCRadio 1252525-546000-MCOMM Bryceville Tower Site (Current units will be placed throught the Co.) ll701 Old North Trail Radio System One major, three minors, full 2 hour load bank test. y y y Generac 35 240 SlNGLE 

BOCCRadio 1252525-546000-MCOMM Yulee Tower Site (Current units will be placed !brought the Co.) 462684 SR 200 Radio System One major, three minors, full2 hour load bank test. y y y Generac 50 240 SlNGLE 

BOCCRadio 1252525-546000-MCOMM Fernandina Beach Tower Site (Current units will be placed throught the Co.) 1559 S 14th St Radio System One major, three minors, full 2 hour load bank test. y y y Generac 25 240 SlNGLE 

BOCCRadio 1252525-546000-MCOMM Yulee Master Site (Current units will be placed throught the Co.) 76001 Bobby Moore Circle Radio System One major, three minors, full2 hour load bank test. y y y Gene rae 50 240 SlNGLE 

BOCCRadio 1252525-546000-MCOMM New Generators will be purchased 13/14 for the Tm.,·er Sites One major, three minors, full2 hour load bank test. y y y Tradewind 35 240 SlNGLE 

BOCCRadio 1252525-546000-MCOMM New Generators will be purchased 13/14 for the Tower Sites One major, three minors, full 2 hour load bank test. y y y Tradewind 50 240 SlNGLE 

BOCCRadio 1252525-546000-MCOMM New Generators will be purchased 13/14 for the Tmver Sites One major, three minors, full2 hour load bank test. y y y Tradewind 35 240 SlNGLE 

BOCCRadio 1252525-546000-MCOMM New Generators will be purchased 13/14 for the Tower Sites One major, three minors, full2 hour load bank test. y y y Tradewind 50 240 SlNGLE 

BOCC Radio 1252525-546000-MCOMM Ne·w Generators ·will be purchased 13/14 for the Tower Sites One major, three minors, full 2 hour load bank test y y y Tradewind 25 240 SlNGLE 

BOCCRadio 1252525-546000-MCOMM NetY Generators will be purchased 13/14 for the Tm-ver Sites One major, three minors, full 2 hour load bank test. y y y Tradewind 50 240 SlNGLE 

BOCCRadio 1252525-546000-MCOMM New Trailer .Mount Gene1·ators will be purchased 13/14 Trailer IVlount One major, three minors, full 2 hour load bank test. y y y Tradewind 50 240 SlNGLE 

Solid Waste 70362534-546000 Landfill East Side Pumping Station 46026 Landfill Road, Callahan 32011 Pumping stations One major, three minors y N y Caterpillar 23.3 240 SlNGLE 

Solid Waste 70362534-546000 Landfill West Side Pumping Station 46026 Landfill Road, Callahan 32011 Pumping stations One major, three minors y N y Hollingsworth 30 240 Three 

Solid Waste 70362534-546000 Landfill Leachate Pumping Station 46026 Landfill Road, Callahan 320 II Leachate Tanks Pumping One major, three minors y N y Orran 40 240 Three 

Solid Waste 70362534-546000 Landfill Flare System (New Unit installed on 4/29/13) 46026 Landfill Road, Callahan 320 II Flare System One major, three minors y N y Tradewind 125 480 Three 

Solid Waste 70369534-546000 Landfill Convenience Center 46026 Landfill Road, Callahan 32011 Convenience Center One major, three minors y N y Caterpillar 60 120/240 Three 

Animal Control 01193519-546036 Animal Control and Care Service 86078 License Road Yulee 32097 Building and Kennels One major, three minors y N y Maspower 35.2 120/240 SlNGLE 

Emergency Services 01253525-546036 Emergency Operations Center 77150 Citizen's Circle Yulee 32097 Building One major, three minors, full2 hour load bank test. y y y GENERAC 150 120/208 Three 

HilliardR&B 03404541-546000 Hilliard Road & Bridge-Office 37356 Pea Farm Rd. Hilliard, Fl. Hilliard Yard Main Office 1 Annual Major Service Inspection N N y GENERAC 30 240 SlNGLE 

Bailey Road 03404541-546000 Hilliard Road & Bridge- Shop 37356 Pea Farm Rd. Hilliard, Fl. Hilliard Yard Maintenance Shop 1 Annual Major Service Inspection N N y GENERAC 30 240 SlNGLE 

Road and Bridge 03404541-546000 Bailey Road & Bridge 3163 Bailey Rd. Fernandina Bch. Fl. Bailey Yard 1 Annual Major Service Inspection N N y GENERAC 20 240 SlNGLE 
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Nassau County Board of County Commissioners 
Request for Quotation Form 

Requesting Department; 

Dep~entAddress: 

Contact: 

Contact email: 
Department Phone: 
Department Fax: 

Facilities Maintenance J)ate: 8/2/13 ---""-="-='-----

45195 Musselwhite RQad, CaJlaltan., FJ 32011 

Don Castle (Maintenance Teah.) 904-753-1046 
or Bob Knott (Director) 904-548-4688 

Bob Knott- Director: bknott@nassaucountyfl.com 
(904) 548-4688 or (9{}4) 5484689 
(9()4) 548-4687 

Product(s)/Service(s) to be pm:chased (list all specifications and requirements): 

See attached Scope of Work for Nassau Coun.ty Board of County Commissioners-Generator 
Annual Maintenance and Service Agreement (See attached docurrtents). 

Please note; 
This document must be completed and sent back with the attached Scope of Work with 
your quotation. 

> If additional/alternate scope of service or product is recommended, please provide as a 
separateattachment: AdditionalAttachment Yes X No 

>!<All payments for products (set'Yices are as perFl01·ida Statutes218.73 &218.74 (Tenns net45 days).* 

Please submit 'written response by: 

Phone: 
Contact: 
Email: 

August 14, 2013 
(D<'!te) 

days. / 

.'i?/trlt3 
Date 

Commen~: ______________________________________________________ __ 



NASSAU COUNTY 
FACILTIES MAINTENANCE DEPARTMENT 

OfficeMailingAddress: 45195 Musselwhite Road- Callahan, FL 32011 

Nassau County BOCC Mailing Address: 
76347 Veterans Way, Suite 4000 -Yulee, FL 32097 
Email: bknott@nassaucountyfl.com · 

SCOPE of WORK 

Telephone: (904) 548-4688 
Alternate: (904) 879-3751 

Fax: (904) 548-4687 

(All requests for quotations must be accompanied by this Scope of Work) 

Nassau County Board of County Commissioners 
Generator Annual Maintenance and Service Agreement 

'-1 .. 

Nassau County is requesting quotations for the Annual Maintenance and Service required for each 
County Owned Generator, as well as any new generators purchased during agreement period. (See 
attached list indicating the location and Generator infonnation.) 

Provide rates for the following: Annual Maintenance and Service as required per Generator: 
• 3 Quarterly Minor Services 
• 1 Major Service 
• 1 Load Bank Test 
• List materials with applicable charges for each Generator as listed. 

Provide rates for the following services or charges: 
• Regular Hourly rate. 
• Overtime Hourly rate. 
• Any additional mileage charge. 
• Truck Charges 
• Environmental Charges (that would be applicable for any work, scheduled or unscheduled). 
• Any charge not listed please provide detailed information. 

*Please Note: 
• Prior to any work, scheduled or unscheduled, proper authorization must be obtained. A PO 

number will be issued for Almual Maintenance, for any additional repairs a control number 
must be obtained by contacting the office or through the technician reporting service needs. 

• Funding Accounts Numbers have been provided to identify each generator by the depmiment. 
Please indicate this on all and any invoice~ to expedite billing processing. 

• As generators are being replaced with new units, we will be placing the existing generators at 
other locations. New units will be under warrantee for the first year. (as noted on attached 
spreadsheet). 

• Please provide costs for each Annual Maintenance Service for the following period. 
o Octl, 2013- Sept 30, 2014= FY 13114 
o Octl, 2014- Sept 30, 2015= FY 14/15 
o Oct1, 2015- Sept 30, 2016= FY 15/16 

Please respond with pricing to our office by August 14, 2013, should you want to be considered for the 
Aimual Maintenance and Service Agreement, if not please respond with a ''No Quote". 

All prices must be guaranteed for three (3) years effective October 1, 2013- through September 30, 
2016. Any questions you may have please contact Don Castle 904-753-1046, you may also email our 
Director-Bob Knott at: bknott@nassaucountyfl.com 



RATES 

Standard rates for JL Power Systems, Inc. 

$82 per hour standard weekday hours 
$123 per hour, overtime to include Saturdays 
$164 per hour for Sundays and holidays 

Billing hours begin from JL Power Systems' driveway 

Mileage is $1.25 per mile 
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( __ JL Power ) These Columns are County Reference. NASSAU COUNTY GENERATORS cc";Gbanges~are lrighliglited in BLUE 
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Nassau County Funding = " " ...< :@ 0 

= = 0 
DEPT. Account (For Budget Purposes). LOCATION ADDRESS PRIMARY USE Service Requirements. 

"' N 0 BRAND KW > 
NAU 71500536-546000 Nassau Amelia Utilities 5390 First Coast Highway, FB FL 32034 Waste Water Plant I Annual Major Service Inspection y CAT 400KVA 480 

NAU 71500536-546000 Nassau Amelia Utilities Omni!Piantation 6027 Villa Partial 3 RepumpWTP I Annual Major Service Inspection y CAT 565KW 480 

NAU 71500536-546000 Nassau Amelia Utilities Plant 5390 First Coast Highway, FB FL 32034 Trailer Mount Generator I Annual Major Service Inspection y Armstrong Power 140KVA 230/480 

NAU 71500536-546000 Nassau Amelia Utilities Plant 5390 First Coast Highway, FB FL 32034 Water Treatment Plant 1 Annual Major Service Inspection y CATD343 312KVA 480 

NAU 71500536-546000 Nassau Amelia Utilities - Lift Station 16 6 Amelia Village Circle, FB FL 32034 Lift Station 16 I Annual Major Service Inspection y ONAN 85KW 208 

JPGC 01188519-546036 James Page Govermnental Complex-Onan 96135 Nassau Place, Yulee COMMC BOARD RM One major, three minors, full 2 hour load bank test. y y y ONAN 60 120/240 

JPGC 01188519-546036 James Page Govermnental Complex-Detroit Diesel 96135 Nassau Place, Yulee Prop AppL SOE & Tax Collector One major, three minors, full 2 hour load bank test. y y y Detroit Diesel 125 480 

Judicial Annex 01189712-534000 Judicial Annex-Courthouse 76435 Veteran's Way, Yulee JUDICIAL COURTHOUSE One major, three minors, full2 hour load bank test. y y y CUMMINS 300 480 

Judicial Annex-Rec" 01189712-534000 Judicial Annex Records Management Building 76435 Veteran's Way, Yulee RECORDS MAN. BLDG. One major, tbree minors, full 2 hour load bank test. y y y CATERPIL 75 480 

Other Co. Bldgs 01193519-546036 Sheriff Admin- 911 Dispatch 50 Bobby Moore Circle, Yulee 911 DISPATCH One major, three minors, full 2 hour load bank test. y y y GENERAC 100 480 

Other Co. Bldgs 01193519-546036 Repeater Tower- West Side at Landfill 46351 Landfill Rd, Callahan Florida. REPEATER TOWER WEST SIDE One m>;jor, three minors, full2 hour load bank test. y y y GENERAC 15 240 

Other Co. Bldgs 01193519-546036 Hilliard Health Clinic (Health Dept Reimburses County) 221 Pecan St., Hilliard, Fl. 32046 HEALTH DEPT. One major, three minors y N y KOHLER 15 240 

0 I 072523-546036 Detention Center, I ail 76212 Nicholas Catinha Rd. Yulee DETENTION CENTER One major, three minors, full 2 hour load bank test. y y y TAYLOR 300 

Fire Rescue 01261526-546000 Fire Rescue #30 (Relocating a Tower Site 50 KW to this location Oct 2013) 86026 Pages Dairy Rd., Yulee FR#30 One major, three minors. y N y GENERAC 50 240 

Fire Rescue 01261526-546000 Fire Rescue #40 Pea Farm Rd. Hilliard FR#40&WELL One major, three minors. y N y GENERAC 50 240 

~~~·< <, .· ~ . G±~eJPa ~4eGGil . ~. \'etSta!ieoi #'f. ~ ~ ~•c• • ~ . . . . . '; ·~ ~. > · .. i . . ~ I4~~~!a5sa.i illel<a.,'Femffiieliaa!lel!.' " . ~ MGBH.,g •. ~ ~AimHftl ~ ~ftj8r S'e~<i6e ffispe~eft- .. ~~ .N I .·~~ . N·, ;x. WBmA ~. co ~ ~ • &~. 2*-~ 
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Fire Rescue 01261526-546000 Fire Rescue #70 (Relocating a Tower Site 50 KW to this location Oct 2013) 4061 Pine Grove Rd.(O'Neil), FB, FL 32034 One major, three minors, full2 hour load bank test. y N y Generac 50 240 

Fire Rescue 01261526-546000 Fire Rescue Head Quarters & Fire Rescue 20 (NEW) 96160 Nassau Place, Yulee, FL 32097 Trailer Mount- One major, three minors, full2 hour load bank test. y N y Tradewind 56 240 

BOCCRadio 1252525-546000-MCOMM Hilliard Tower Site (Current units will be placed through! the Co.) 371105 Oxford St, Hilliard Radio System One major, three minors, full 2 hour load bank test. y y y Generac 35 240 

BOCCRadio 1252525-546000-MCOMM Callahan Tower Site (Current units will be placed through! the Co.) 46351 Landfill Rd Radio System One major, three minors, full 2 hour load bank test. y y y Generac 50 240 

BOCCRadio 1252525-546000-MCOMM Bryceville Tower Site (Current units will be placed through! the Co.) 11701 Old North Trail Radio System One major, three minors, full2 hour load bank test. y y y Generac 35 240 

BOCCRadio 1252525-546000-MCOMM Yulee Tower Site (Current units will be placed through! the Co.) 462684 SR 200 Radio System One major, three minors, full2 hour load bank test. y y y Generac 50 240 

BOCCRadio 1252525-546000-MCOMM Fernandina Beach Tower Site (Current units will be placed through! the Co.) 1559 S 14th St Radio System One major, three minors, full2 hour load bank test. y y y Generac 25 240 

BOCCRadio 1252525-546000-MCOMM Yulee Master Site (Current units will be placed through! the Co.) 76001 Bobby Moore Circle Radio System One m>;jor, three minors, full 2 hour load bank test. y y y Gene rae 50 240 

BOCCRadio 1252525-546000-MCOMM New Generators will be purchased 13/14 for the Tower Sites One major, three minors, full 2 hour load bank test. y y y Tradewind 35 240 

BOCCRadio 1252525-546000-MCOMM New Generators will be purchased 13/14 for the Tower Sites One major, three minors, full2 hour load bank test. y y y Tradewind 50 240 

BOCCRadio 1252525-546000-MCOMM New Generators will be purchased 13/14 for the Tower Sites One major, three minors, full 2 hour load bank test. y y y Tradewind 35 240 

BOCCRadio 1252525-546000-MCOMM New Generators will be purchased 13/14 for the Tower Sites One major, three minors, full 2 hour load bank test. y y y Tradewind 50 240 

BOCCRadio 1252525-546000-MCOMM New Generators will be purchased 13/14 for the Tower Sites One major, three minors, full 2 hour load bank test. y y y Tradewind 25 240 

BOCCRadio 1252525-546000-MCOMM New Generators will be purchased 13/14 for the Tower Sites One major, three minors, full 2 hour load bank test. y y y Tradewind 50 240 

BOCCRadio 1252525-546000-MCOMM New Trailer Mount Generators will be purchased 13/14 Trailer Mount One major, three minors, full2 hour load bank test. y y y Tradewind 50 240 

Solid Waste 70362534-546000 Landfill East Side Pumping Station 46026 Landfill Road, Callahan 320 ll Pumping stations One major, three minors y N y Caterpillar 23.3 240 

Solid Waste 70362534-546000 Landfill West Side Pumping Station 46026 Landfill Road, Callahan 32011 Pumping stations One major, three minors y N y Hollingsworth 30 240 

Solid Waste 70362534-546000 Landfill Leachate Pumping Station 46026 Landfill Road, Callahan 32011 Leachate Tanks Pumping One major, three minors y N y Orran 40 240 

Solid Waste 70362534-546000 Landfill Flare System (New Unit installed on 4/29/13) 46026 Landfill Road, Callahan 32011 Flare System One major, three minors y N y Tradewind 125 480 

Solid Waste 70369534-546000 Landfill Convenience Center 46026 Landfill Road, Callahan 32011 Convenience Center One major, three minors y N y Caterpillar 60 120/240 

Animal Control 01193519-546036 Animal Control and Care Service 86078 License Road Yulee 32097 Building and Kennels One major, three minors y N y Maspower 35.2 120/240 

Emergency Services 01253525-546036 Emergency Operations Center 77150 Citizen's Circle Yulee 32097 Building One major, tbree minors, full2 hour load bank test. y y y GENERAC !50 120/208 

HilliardR&B 03404541-546000 Hilliard Road & Bridge-Office 37356 Pea Farm Rd. Hilliard, Fl. Hilliard Yard Main Office I Annual M>;ior Service Inspection N N y GENERAC 30 240 

Bailey Road 03404541-546000 Hilliard Road & Bridge - Shop 37356 Pea Farm Rd. Hilliard, Fl. Hilliard Yard Maintenance Shop 1 Annual Major Service Inspection N N y GENERAC 30 240 

Road and Bridge 03404541-546000 Bailey Road & Bridge 3163 Bailey Rd. Fernandina Bch. Fl. Bailey Yard 1 Annual M>;jor Service Inspection N N y GENERAC 20 240 
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Nassau County Board of County Commissioners 
Request for Quotation Form 

Requesting Department: Facilities Maintenance Date: -----"8=/2=/1=3 __ _ 

Department Address: 45195 Musselwhite R()ad, Callahan, Fl32011 

Contact 

Contact email: 

Don Castle (Maintenance Tech.) 904-753-1046 
or Bob Knott (DITector) 904-548-4688 

Department Phone: 
Bob Knott- Director: hknott@nassancountyflcom 
(904) 548-4688 or (904) 548-4689 

Department Fax: (904) 548-4687 

Product( s )/Service(s) to be purchased (list all specifications and requjrements ): 

See attached Scope of Work for Nassau County Board of County Commissioners-Generator 
Annual Maintenance and Service Agreement (See attached docur:O.ents). 

Please note: 
This document must be completed and sent back with the attached Scope of Work with _ 
your quotation. 

:> If additional/alternate scope of service or product is recommended, please provide as a 
separate attachment: Additional Attachment Yes X No 

*Allpaymentsforproducts/servicesare as perFloridaSta:tutes 218.73 &218.74 (Termsnet45 days).* 

Please submit written response by: Angustl013 
-(Date) 

Faxed I Scanned!Emailed to Vendor on ffj ~1 t .3 to the attention of :Jfm r~';V iJ/!l,_yriJ..s 
~ I 

To be completed by vendor: 
Vendor Name: ~/ ol{td~_D..-:e--1-R.o ;r D Ee->e-1- AI /r;oA1 "hi.J!-~. 
Address: ~ Po r3ocx t & ~95 

J a..ck.s&-nv,· Iff . ti!~av----::~-r-d.,.-4- "?;~ -:J. 'Is 
(Jo7- q V '6 - ?1'-fo 2- Fax: I ·- f? {s; ~ -cto 1-~a G tf Phone: 
,1{ m nvf ;J a...co{:>_5 

\ j D ,CO\):) @l-C2JJc._. CJ:JYY\ 
Contact: 
Email: 

Comments: -------------------------------------------------------
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NASSAU COUNTY 
FACILTIES MAINTENANCE DEPARTMENT 

Office Mailing Address: 45195 Musselwhite Road- Callahan, FL 32011 

Nassau County BOCC Mailing Address: 
76347 Veterans Way, Suite 4000-Yulee, FL 32097 
Email: bknott@nassaucountyfl..com -

SCOPE ofWORK 

Telephone: (904) 548-4688 
Alternate: (904) 879-3751 

Fax: (904) 548-4687 

{All requests for quotations must be accompanied by this Scope of Work) 

Nassau County>Bilard of.Coii:nty~C.olillllissioners 
Generator.Amncii:Mauit~lliiitce·.andSemce.Agreement 

.. . .::r.;·, . ./::-::-:1 . --$1.. .. £ ~:-~1: -~~ . ~ -~~~ t~ : . ~-::t . . . -~: . ..:. . .. ~ 

Nassau County is reqq~~ qudW,tioris fm:the Ann®. ~enance _ffi?:9- S~r,vice required for each 
County Owned GeJ:t~rator;',is welll'!S ahy new generators p-U:rchaseg,1diinng _ig:J:~ement period. (See 
attached list indicat.ihg thgilod-tion and Generator information.) - . . :., ;:~·/" '; :.l·: •;:;;~::~i:>;;.·;.~tt::"B ./'":··. . . .· . . • : . :r·::: <k~;·~·=·. --~ . :~·.) 

Provide rates {9i t1+~- fqP,oWJhg: Annual Maintefl?D.ce and Service as req~s};tp,xr .d:_~nerator: 

: ~ ~:mf~-ib_;6~~-~-;:;:?{Syr;ices . ,· .,'"~;~rp~1 ·:; 
- ''! 

• 1 Load Baril{ Test ' 
• Lid~t,;i::ffils.iWith appJjcable charges for each Generator as listed. 

Provide rat~s fJf~he following services or charges: 
• Re@lar :ftoUriy rate . 
., avJhlme Ho~!Y.r?.te.. 1 
• Any!'hdilj:ijm).ai1;!;iil~;ig~ charge. /" __ 'I 
• Truck:Ji(~g~s ~L- ·_ · ' . .-. . _ ·; ·,, . ; ' 
• Envir~~enW, charg~ (that would be applicfl,bie for any woJ%, s~heduled,9~ unscheduled). 
• Any cruJ~~ notlisted'p~~e provide ¢letap~¢'o~tion. .'; ·' ,. _/·r · 

l- _}::·; • .; • ·.'/.":"·=·r.. .. . .... : .. ·; 
*Please Note: ''~,, ·"" .,'{·:' .. .."t -:' _.J·l 

e Prior to any wdHr, ~ched-q].0.-.9r unscheduled, prop~r_ ~1!t!i9iiiatiop. fu:ast be obtained. A PO 
number will be isSrt&i fqr' AhP.Wil }0:ain~:gilpg~, fof any~additi9:tihl repairs a control number 
must be obtained by cohtactip.g the of~jd~'dr through tgy technician reporting service needs. 

• Funding Accounts Numbers hive been prcrvided.-to .. rdentify each generator by the department. 
Please indicate this on all and any invoice~ to expedite billing processing. 

• AB generators are being replaced with new units, we will be placing the existing generators at 
other locations. New units will be under warrantee for the first year. (as noted on attached 
spreadsheet) . 

., Please provide costs for each Annual Maintenance Service for the following period. 
o Octl, 2013- Sept 30, 2014= FY 13/14 
o Octl, 2014- Sept30, 2015=FY 14/15 
o Octl, 2015- Sept 30, 2016= FY 15/16 

Please respond with pricing to our office by August 14, 2013, should you want to be considered for the 
Aimual11aintenance and Service Agreement, if not please respond with a "No Quote". 

All prices must be guaranteed for three (3) years effective October 1, 2013- through September 30, 
2016. Any questions you may have please contact Don Castle 904-753-1046, you may also email our 
Director-Bob Knott at: bknott@nassaucountyfLcom 



Suzie Fontes 

From: 
Sent: 
Subject: 

Your message 

Mark McGauley <mmcgauley@fdda.com> 
Sunday, August 11, 2013 10:17 PM 
Read: Nassau County Generator- Request for Quote 

To: mmcgauley@fdda.com 
Subject: 

was read on 8/11/2013 10:17 PM. 

1 



Suzie Fontes 

From: 
Sent: 
Subject: 

Your message 

Mark McGauley <mmcgauley@fdda.com> 
Friday, August 02, 2013 1:24 PM 
Read: Nassau County Generator- Request for Quote 

To: mmcgauley@fdda.com 
Subject: 

was read on 8/2/2013 1:24 PM. 

1 



Suzie Fontes 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 
Attachments: 

postmaster@nassaucountyfl.com 
Friday, August 02, 2013 10:25 AM 
Suzie Fontes 
Delivery Status Notification (Relay) 

ATT150138.txt; FW: Nassau County Generator- Request for Quote 

This is an automatically generated Delivery Status Notification. 

Your message has been successfully relayed to the following recipients, but the requested delivery 
status notifications may not be generated by the destination. 

mmcgauley@fdda.com 

1 



NASSAU COUNTY GENERATOR SERVICE 
2013 REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL PREPARED BY FLORIDA DETROIT DIESEL-ALLISON, INC. 

TOTAL COST OF 
QUART. INSPECT QUARTERLY 2-HR LOAD BANK 

LOCATION MAKE KW COST (minor) #OF INSP'S INSPECTION ANNUAL PM (major) TEST COST 2014 Total Cost 2015 Total Cost 2016 Total Cost 

Nassau Utilities 

5390 First Coast CAT 350 $135.00 3 $405.00 $695.00 $1,100.00 $1,133.00 $1,166.99 

6027 Villa Partial $135.00 3 $405.00 $785.00 $1,190.00 $1,225.70 $1,262.47 

5390 First Coast -Trailer Trailer 115 $135.00 3 $405.00 $589.00 $994.00 $1,023.82 $1,054.53 

5390 First Coast WWTP 250 $135.00 3 $405.00 $589.00 $994.00 $1,023.82 $1,054.53 

Lift Station 16 85 $135.00 3 $405.00 $495.00 $900.00 $927.00 $954.81 

Repeater Tower- West Side Landfill 15 $115.00 3 $345.00 $325.00 $500.00 $1,170.00 $1,205.10 $1,241.25 

Fire & Rescue Station 20 Trailer!Tradewinds 56 $115.00 3 $345.00 $495.00 $500.00 $1,340.00 $1 ,380.20 $1,421.61 

Tower Site 1 25 $115.00 3 $345.00 $350.00 $500.00 $1,195.00 $1,230.85 $1,267.78 

Tower Site 2 35 $115.00 3 $345.00 $355.00 $500.00 $1,200.00 $1,236.00 $1,273.08 

Tower Site 3 35 $115.00 3 $345.00 $355.00 $500.00 $1,200.00 $1,236.00 $1,273.08 

Tower Site 4 50 $115.00 3 $345.00 $495.00 $500.00 $1,340.00 $1,380.20 $1,421.61 

Tower Site 5 50 $115.00 3 $345.00 $495.00 $500.00 $1,340.00 $1,380.20 $1,421.61 

Tower Site 6 50 $115.00 3 $345.00 $495.00 $500.00 $1,340.00 $1,380.20 $1,421.61 

Tower Site 7 50 $115.00 3 $345.00 $495.00 $500.00 . $1,340.00 $1,380.20 $1,421.61 
EMERGENCY SERVICES GENERAC 150 $135.00 3 $405.00 $595.00 $530.00 $1,530.00 $1,575.00 $1,623.17 
JUDICIAL COMPLEX CUMMINS 300 $135.00 3 $405.00 $645.00 $720.00 $1,770.00 $1,823.10 $1,877.79 

RECORDS MANAGEMNT BLDG CAT 75 $135.00 3 $405.00 $529.00 $545.00 $1,479.00 $1,523.37 $1,569.07 

SHERIFF ADMIN- 911 DISPATCH GENERAC 100 $135.00 3 $405.00 $486.00 $520.00 $1,411.00 $1,453.33 $1,496.92 

LANDFILL REPEATER TOWER GENERAC 15 $125.00 3 $375.00 $345.00 $450.00 $1,170.00 $1,205.10 $1,241.25 

DETENTION CENTER, (NEW JAIL) (VOLVO PENTA) 300 $135.00 3 $405.00 $595.00 $720.00 $1,720.00 $1,771.60 $1,824.74 
FIRE RESCUE #30 GENERAC 15 $125.00 3 $375.00 $343.00 $0.00 $718.00 $739.54 $761.62 
FIRE RESCUE #40 GENERAC 50 $125.00 3 $375.00 $438.00 $0.00 $813.00 $837.39 $862.51 
FIRE RESCUE #20 Tradewinds 56 $125.00 3 $375.00 $495.00 $0.00 $870.00 $896.10 $922.98 
FIRE RESCUE #60 GENERAC 15 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 n/a n/a 
FIRE RESCUE #70 KUBOTA 6 $0.00 0 $0.00 $258.00 $0.00 $258.00 $265.75 $275.00 
VOLUNTEER STATION #7 KUBOTA 6 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 
BAILEY ROAD & BRIDGE GENERAC 20 $0.00 0 $0.00 $337.00 $0.00 $337.00 $347.11 $357.52 
HILLIARD CNTY BLDG. KOHLER 15 $125.00 3 $375.00 $357.00 $0.00 $732.00 $753.96 $776.57 
HILLIARD R & B OFFICE GENERAC 30 $0.00 0 $0.00 $325.00 $0.00 $325.00 $334.75 $344.79 
HILLIARD R & B SHOP GENERAC 30 $0.00 0 $0.00 $325.00 $0.00 $325.00 $334.75 $344.79 
VOLUNTEER STATION #3 KUBOTA 6 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 
HILLIARD TOWER SITE GENERAC 35 $135.00 3 $405.00 $454.00 $505.00 $1,364.00 $1,404.92 $1,447.06 
CALLAHAN TOWER SITE GENERAC 50 $135.00 3 $405.00 $454.00 $520.00 $1,379.00 $1,421.29 $1,463.92 
BRYCEVILLE TOWER SITE GENERAC 35 $135.00 3 $405.00 $454.00 $505.00 $1,364.00 $1,404.92 $1,447.06 
YULEE TOWER SITE GENERAC 50 $135.00 3 $405.00 $454.00 $520.00 $1,379.00 $1,421.29 $1,447.06 
FERN. BEACH TOWER SITE GENERAC 25 $135.00 3 $405.00 $443.00 $485.00 $1,333.00 $1,372.99 $1,414.17 
YULEE MASTER SITE GENERAC 50 $135.00 3 $405.00 $454.00 $520.00 $1,379.00 $1,421.29 $1,447.06 
N.C.Governmental Complex MTU 125 $135.00 3 $405.00 $520.00 $520.00 $1,615.00 $1,663.45 $1,713.35 
Landfill East Pump Station Military 30 $125.00 3 $375.00 $416.00 na $791.00 $814.73 $839.17 
Landfill West Pump Station Military 30 $125.00 3 $375.00 $416.00 na $791.00 $814.73 $893.17 
Landfill Leachate Station On an 40 $125.00 3 $375.00 $423.00 na $798.00 $821.94 $846.59 
Landfill Flare Station Kohler 125 $125.00 3 $375.00 $438.00 na $813.00 $837.39 $862.51 
Landfill Conv. Center Cat 60 $125.00 3 $375.00 $465.00 na $840.00 $865.20 $891.15 
Animal Services Manpower 35 $125.00 3 $375.00 $454.00 na $829.00 $853.87 $879.48 
Emergency Operation Center Generac 150 $135.00 3 $405.00 $520.00 $520.00 $1,445.00 $1,488.35 $1,533.00 

$46,221.00 $47,609.50 $49,060.03 .. 
Houri Rates For Add1tlonal Serv1ces 
MONDAY- FRIDAY 7:30AM- 4:00PM $80.00 PER HOUR- PORT TO PORT 
MONDAY- FRIDAY 4:00PM- 7:30AM $120.00 PER HOUR- PORT TO PORT 
SATURDAY- ALL DAY $120.00 PER HOUR- PORT TO PORT 
SUNDAY -ALL DAY $160.00 PER HOUR- PORT TO PORT 
HOLIDAYS- ALL DAY $225.00 PER HOUR - PORT TO PORT 
THERE IS A 7.5% CHARGE ON ALL LABOR. 
MILEAGE CHARGE- $50.00 Per Tri OTHER THAN SCHEDULED MAINTENANCE. 
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Suzie Fontes 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 

Dianne Sowell <gensets@bellsouth.net> 
Wednesday, August 14, 20131:58 PM 
Suzie Fontes 

Subject: RE: Nassau County Generator- Request for Quote 

Suzie Fontes, 
We will have to take a "No Bid" at this time. 

Thank you for the consideration. 

Bill Crumbley 
B&K Diesel Electric Service, Inc. 

From: Suzie Fontes [mailto:sfontes@nassaucountyfl.com] 
Sent: Friday, August 9, 2013 3:43 PM 
To: gensets@bellsouth.net 
Subject: FW: Nassau County Generator- Request for Quote 

Please see the attached Amendment #1 to the Generator Spreadsheet sent out on August 2, 2013. I also 
attached the Original Request - Scope of Work. We are extending the due date to August 19, 2013 due 
to the revisions. 
Thank you, 

From: Suzie Fontes 
Sent: Friday, August 02, 2013 10:07 AM 
To: 'gensets@bellsouth.net' 
Subject: Nassau County Generator- Request for Qw;>te 

Emailed on Behalf of Don Castle: 

Please see all attachments. 

Suzie Fontes- Office Manager 
Nassau County Facilities Maintenance/Parks & Recreation Dept. 
45195 Musselwhite Road, Callahan, Fl 32011 
Office 904-548-4688 ext 6303 Fax: 904-548-4687 
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Suzie Fontes 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 
Attachments: 

Your message 

To: gensets@bellsouth.net 

Dianne Sowell <gensets@bellsouth.net> 
Tuesday, August 13, 2013 8:19 AM 
Suzie Fontes 
Read: Nassau County Generator- Request for Quote 
A TT235227.txt 

Subject: FW: Nassau County Generator- Request for Quote 
Sent: 8/9/2013 3:43PM 

was read on 8/13/2013 8:18AM. 

1 



Suzie Fontes 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 
Attachments: 

postmaster@ nassaucountyfl.com 

Friday, August 09, 2013 3:48 PM 

Suzie Fontes 

Delivery Status Notification (Relay) 

A TT220611.txt; FW: Nassau County Generator- Request for Quote 

This is an automatically generated Delivery Status Notification. 

Your message has been successfully relayed to the following recipients, but the requested delivery 
status notifications may not be generated by the destination. 

gensets@ bellsouth .net 
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Nassau County Board of County Commissioners 
Request for Quotation Form 

Requesting Department: 

Department Address: 

Contact: 

Contact email: 
Department Phone: 
Department Fax: 

Facilities Maintenance !)ate: 8/2/13 ------"-'--'=-=-=-----

45195 Musselwhite Road, Callahan, Fl32011 

Don Castle (Maintenance Tech.) 904-753-1046 
or Bob Knott (Director) 904-548-4688 

Bob Knott- Director: bknott@nassaucountyfl.com 
(904) 548-4688 or (904) 548-4689 
(904) 548-4687 

Product(s)/Service(s) to be purchased (list all specifications and requirements): 

See attached Scope of Work for Nassau County Board of County Commissioners-Generator 
Annual Maintenance and Service Agreement (See attached documents). 

Please note: 
This document must be completed and sent back with the attached Scope of Work with 
your quotation. 

:>- If additional/alternate scope of service or product is recommended, please provide as a 
separate attachment: Additional Attachment Yes X No 

*All payments for products /services are as per Florida Statutes 218.73 & 218.74 (Terms net 45 days). * 

Please submit written response by: August 14,2013 
(Date) 

Faxed I Scanned/Emailed to Vendor on ~/ ;;J..j J .3 to the attention of 6 ~I< PL.Zi]J 

To be completed by vendor: 
VendorName: 6-L-- k ~ 
Address: 

Phone: Fax: 
Contact: 
Email: 

Attached is a written quote from our company, which is valid for ____ days. 

Signature !)ate 

Comments: -------------------------------


